
Spousal Service Agreements: 
Negotiating Pay, Travel, and Tax



Build your schedule and join your 
colleagues in the Guidebook interact feed. 

Thank you to our sponsor



Presenters

Michael Frandsen, President, Wittenberg University

Sharon Frandsen, Presidential Spouse, Wittenberg University

Tyrone P. Thomas, Partner, Holland & Knight

Chair

Robert A. Clark, President, Husson University



















Pros and Cons of Employment/Volunteer Service Agreements

PROS CONS

• Provides additional credibility and 
clarity for the role

• Can clarify expectations relative to 
predecessors

• Allows for possible compensation
• Establishes position relative to tax and 

insurance issues
• Legitimizes the provision of assistance 

to the spouse/partner for a variety of 
needs, e.g., staff support, housing, 
child care, etc.

• If paid, spouse/partner may continue 
to receive benefits such as retirement, 
social security, etc.

• Reduces flexibility for the 
spouse/partner

• Requires reporting relationship that 
can often be awkward

• Can create resentment within the 
campus community—doesn't 
"deserve" this job...padding the 
president's pay at the expense of 
other institutional needs

• Imposes employment rules on the 
spouse/partner, e.g., mandatory 
trainings

• Can constrain the couple's relationship 
and communications if both the 
president and spouse/partner are 
employees



Q&A Session



Thank you for attending 
this session!
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